
  

AGENDA 
January 27, 2015 
Regular Meeting 

 
Town Council Chambers - 120 Civic Plaza Drive 

1:00 PM  

1. CALL TO ORDER BY THE HONORABLE MAYOR DANIEL R. BARRONE

2. ROLL CALL

3. PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE

4. MOMENT OF SILENCE

5. APPROVAL OF AGENDA

6. AWARDS AND RECOGNITIONS 

A. Years of Service Awards

Presentation of Years of Service Awards to employees in recognition of their 
years of service to the Town of Taos: 
  5 Years of Service 
10 Years of Service 
15 Years of Service 
20 Years of Service

B. 2014 Employee of the Year Award

Presentation of 2014 Employee of the Year Award- two employees have been 
selected: Linda Montoya, Facilities Services Maintenance Specialist AND Dinah 
Gonzales, Planning, Community & Economic Development Assistant.

C. Appreciation of Community Volunteers

Presentation of plaques of appreciation honoring community volunteers serving on 
the Town’s advisory boards, commissions and events with extended terms of 
service.

D. Introduction of Hired Employees

New Hires: 
Amberley Valdez, Legal Assistant/Paralegal 
Full-Time Employee 
Legal Department 
Emergency Appointment effective: 12/18/2014  

January 27, 2015 -  Page 1



Conversion to probationary employee effective: 01/15/2015

7. PRESENTATIONS

A. Presentation by the Taos Arts Council

Presentation by the Taos Arts Council for the January "Artist of the Month".

8. CITIZENS FORUM - Citizens wishing to speak shall have the opportunity to do so for 5 
minutes. No action may be taken 

9. PUBLIC HEARINGS

A. CDBG Planning Grant

The purpose of this public hearing will be to report on past CDBG program 
activities and to receive public input on community development needs and 
suggestions for future CDBG planning projects. NO ACTION WILL BE TAKEN 
DURING THE PUBLIC HEARING.

10. MATTERS FROM STAFF 

A. Cell Tower

1.      Matters related to a Town RFP for construction and operation of a cell tower 
on Town property; presentation, discussion, consideration and possible action;  
a.      Report by the Finance Dept. on the bid response 
b.      Recommendation of staff 
c.      Presentation and/or Q &A by Comnet Wireless on their proposal 

B. Financial Update

Presentation of the monthly financial report for the period ending December 31, 
2014. 

C. Draft RFP for Financial Advisor Services

Direction to staff on draft Request for Proposals for Financial Advisor Services.

D. Activities, Road Closures, Farmers Market

Presentations, discussion, consideration and possible action or direction to staff 
concerning closing the Plaza to vehicular traffic as well as various roads throughout 
town for activities, parades, special events and possibly the Farmers Market.

E. License for Use of Airport Well

Discussion, consideration and possible approval of a License between the Town of 
Taos and Northern Mountain Constructors, Inc. for the use of the airport well to 
pump water to be used for the construction of the airport.

F. Amendment No. 1 to Contract TT-15-01 with Griffin and Associates

Consideration and possible approval of Amendment No. 1 to contract TT-15-01 
with Griffin and Associates for the marketing and advertising of the Town of Taos 
as a tourist destination.

G. Proposed Ordinance, Fine Schedule and Conditions

Proposed ordinance, schedule and conditions for fire department fines and 
fees. For discussion purposes for the information of Council and to receive 
direction to staff as to the scheduling for a public hearing as a proposed ordinance.

H. Other Matters

11. TOWN MANAGER'S REPORT 

January 27, 2015 -  Page 2



A. Other Matters

12. MATTERS AND REPORTS FROM THE MAYOR

A. Potential Meeting with Taos Pueblo Tribal Government Officials

Invitation from the Mayor and Council to meet with the Taos Pueblo Tribal 
Government officials.

B. Potential Date for a Joint Meeting

Discussion regarding a potential date for a joint meeting between the Town and the 
County.

C. Workshop Meeting Date(s)

Discussion the next Workshop Meeting date(s).

D. Other Matters

13. MATTERS AND REPORTS FROM THE COUNCIL

A. Other Matters

B. Town of Taos/UNM Parking Agreement

Discussion, consideration and possible action regarding a parking agreement 
between the Town of Taos and UNM for use by UNM-Taos downtown campus 
students of parking at the Town Hall and Library.

14. EXECUTIVE SESSION

A. PERSONNEL MATTERS

(Executive and Public Session Informational Items/Action Items) 
Discussion, consideration, and decisions regarding limited personnel matters 
relating to the final recommendations for the Employee Compensation Plan.  These 
items may be discussed in closed session under Open Meetings Act exemption 10-
15-1-(H)(2), which allows for discussion of limited personnel matters.

B. PERSONNEL MATTERS

(Executive and Public Session Informational Items/Action Items) 
Discussion, consideration, decisions and possible direction to 
staff regarding limited personnel matters relating to the positions of Tourism and 
Marketing Director and Planning, Community and Economic Development 
Director.  These items may be discussed in closed session under Open Meetings 
Act exemption 10-15-1-(H)(2), which allows for discussion of limited personnel 
matters.

15. ADJOURNMENT

� To request details on an agenda item please contact the Town Clerk at 400 Camino de la 
Placita, Taos New Mexico, 87571 (575) 751-2005. 

� If you are an individual with a disability who is in need of aid or service to attend and/or 
participate in a meeting of the Town of Taos Council, please contact the office of the Town 
Clerk at 400 Camino de la Placita, Taos New Mexico, 87571 (575) 751-2005 at least 24 hours 
in advance. 

� For copies of this agenda please pick-up at Town Hall. You may also view the agenda and the 
agenda packet at http://taospublic.novusagenda.com/ 

January 27, 2015 -  Page 3



 

  
 

January 27, 2015  
 

Title:

Years of Service Awards

Summary:

Presentation of Years of Service Awards to employees in recognition of their years of service to the Town of Taos: 

  5 Years of Service 

10 Years of Service 

15 Years of Service 

20 Years of Service

Background:

Each year the Mayor and Council recognize employees who have reached these milestones in their career with the Town.

Staff Recommendation:

Recommend Approval/Disapproval:

Recommend Approval

 

Attachments:

Click to download

 Years of Service List 

 

January 27, 2015 -  Page 4



 

  
 

January 27, 2015  
 

Title:

2014 Employee of the Year Award

Summary:

Presentation of 2014 Employee of the Year Award- two employees have been selected: Linda Montoya, Facilities Services 

Maintenance Specialist AND Dinah Gonzales, Planning, Community & Economic Development Assistant.

Background:

The primary characteristic considered for Employee of the Year is an extraordinary dedication to public service, which is 

demonstrated by excellence in professionalism, work quality, customer service and teamwork.  

Staff Recommendation:

Recommend Approval/Disapproval:

Recommend Approval

 

Attachments:

Click to download

No Attachments Available

 

January 27, 2015 -  Page 5



 

  
 

January 27, 2015  
 

Title:

Appreciation of Community Volunteers

Summary:

Presentation of plaques of appreciation honoring community volunteers serving on the Town’s advisory boards, commissions and 

events with extended terms of service.

Background:

Staff Recommendation:

Recommend Approval/Disapproval:

Recommend Disapproval

 

Attachments:

Click to download

No Attachments Available

 

January 27, 2015 -  Page 6



 

  
 

January 27, 2015  
 

Title:

Introduction of Hired Employees

Summary:

New Hires: 

Amberley Valdez, Legal Assistant/Paralegal 

Full-Time Employee 

Legal Department 

Emergency Appointment effective: 12/18/2014  

Conversion to probationary employee effective: 01/15/2015

Background:

Staff Recommendation:

Recommend Approval/Disapproval:

Recommend Approval

 

Attachments:

Click to download

No Attachments Available

 

January 27, 2015 -  Page 7



 

  
 

January 27, 2015  
 

Title:

Presentation by the Taos Arts Council

Summary:

Presentation by the Taos Arts Council for the January "Artist of the Month".

Background:

Staff Recommendation:

Recommend Approval/Disapproval:

Recommend Approval

 

Attachments:

Click to download

No Attachments Available

 

January 27, 2015 -  Page 8



 

  
 

January 27, 2015  
 

Title:

CDBG Planning Grant

Summary:

The purpose of this public hearing will be to report on past CDBG program activities and to receive public input on community 

development needs and suggestions for future CDBG planning projects. NO ACTION WILL BE TAKEN DURING THE PUBLIC 

HEARING.

Background:

The Town of Taos is eligible to apply for up to $50,000 for a CDBG planning grant. 

Staff Recommendation:

It is the recommendation of Staff to apply for a Parks Master Plan.

Recommend Approval/Disapproval:

Recommend Approval

 

Attachments:

Click to download

No Attachments Available

 

January 27, 2015 -  Page 9



 

  
 

January 27, 2015  
 

Title:

Cell Tower

Summary:

1.      Matters related to a Town RFP for construction and operation of a cell tower on Town property; presentation, discussion, 

consideration and possible action;  

a.      Report by the Finance Dept. on the bid response 

b.      Recommendation of staff 

c.      Presentation and/or Q &A by Comnet Wireless on their proposal 

Background:

Staff Recommendation:

Recommend Approval/Disapproval:

Recommend Disapproval

 

Attachments:

Click to download

No Attachments Available

 

January 27, 2015 -  Page 10



 

  
 

January 27, 2015  
 

Title:

Financial Update

Summary:

Presentation of the monthly financial report for the period ending December 31, 2014. 

Background:

Submitted by (Marietta Fambro) 

Staff Recommendation:

Recommend Approval/Disapproval:

Recommend Disapproval

 

Attachments:

Click to download

 December Monthly GRT Report 

 December 2014 Monthly Classifications 

 January Monthly GRT Report 

 January 2015 Monthly Classifications 

 

January 27, 2015 -  Page 11



FINANCE DEPARTMENT

July, 2013 - June, 2014

General General Capital Capital Capital Water/WastewaterWater/WastewaterTotal Gross Taxable Monthly Average

Fund Fund Improv. Projects Projects Solidwaste Projects Projects Receipts Tax Effective Gross Growth Growth

1 ¢ 1.225 ¢ 1/4 ¢ 1/16 ¢  (1st) 1/16 ¢  (2nd) 1/16 ¢ 1/16 ¢ (3rd) 1/16 ¢ (4th) Revenues Tax Rate Receipts Rate Rate

July (May) 297,203 364,074 74,301 18,575 18,575 18,575 18,575 18,322 828,201 2.7875% 29,711,261 1.35% 1.39%

August (June) 356,710 436,970 89,178 22,294 22,294 22,294 22,294 22,294 994,329 2.7875% 35,671,000 13.99% 7.88%

September (July) 354,567 434,344 88,642 22,160 22,160 22,160 22,160 22,160 988,355 2.7875% 35,456,667 5.04% 6.86%

October (Aug) 330,427 404,773 82,607 20,652 20,652 20,652 20,652 20,652 921,066 2.7875% 33,042,728 1.14% 5.39%

November (Sept) 304,558 373,084 76,139 19,035 19,035 19,035 19,035 19,035 848,955 2.7875% 30,455,795 2.18% 4.78%

December (Oct) 309,166 378,728 77,291 19,323 19,323 19,323 19,323 19,323 861,800 2.7875% 30,916,589 3.65% 4.60%

January (Nov) 276,779 339,054 69,195 17,299 17,299 17,299 17,299 17,299 771,521 2.7875% 27,677,888 0.13% 4.02%

February (Dec) 368,666 451,616 92,166 23,042 23,042 23,042 23,042 23,042 1,027,656 2.7875% 36,866,591 9.88% 4.82%

March (Jan) 279,397 342,262 69,849 17,462 17,462 17,462 17,462 17,462 778,820 2.7875% 27,939,725 -1.99% 4.11%

April (Feb) 284,223 348,173 71,056 17,764 17,764 17,764 17,764 17,764 792,272 2.7875% 28,422,317 8.73% 4.51%

May (March) 301,201 368,971 75,300 18,825 18,825 18,825 18,825 18,825 839,597 2.7875% 30,120,068 -0.73% 4.03%

June (Apr) 285,193 349,361 71,298 17,825 17,825 17,825 17,825 17,825 794,975 2.7875% 28,519,277 6.60% 4.23%

Total 3,748,090 4,591,410 937,022 234,256 234,256 234,256 234,256 234,003 10,447,547 374,799,907

July, 2014 - June, 2015

General General Capital Capital Capital Water/WastewaterWater/WastewaterTotal Gross Taxable Monthly Average

Fund Fund Improv. Projects Projects Solidwaste Projects Projects Receipts Tax Effective Gross Growth Growth

1 ¢ 1.225 ¢ 1/4 ¢ 1/16 ¢  (1st) 1/16 ¢  (2nd) 1/16 ¢ 1/16 ¢ (3rd) 1/16 ¢ (4th) Revenues Tax Rate Receipts Rate Rate

July (May) 286,709 351,219 71,677 17,919 17,919 17,919 17,919 17,919 799,202 2.7875% 28,670,915 -3.50% -3.50%

August (June) 309,470 379,100 77,367 19,342 19,342 19,342 19,342 19,342 862,646 2.7875% 30,946,952 -13.24% -8.82%

September (July) 342,546 419,619 85,637 21,409 21,409 21,409 21,409 21,409 954,848 2.7875% 34,254,622 -3.39% -6.91%

October (Aug) 362,119 443,596 90,530 22,632 22,632 22,632 22,632 22,632 1,009,408 2.7875% 36,211,935 9.59% -2.84%

November (Sept) 318,001 389,552 79,500 19,875 19,875 19,875 19,875 19,875 886,429 2.7875% 31,800,132 4.41% -1.49%

December (Oct) 345,411 423,129 86,353 21,588 21,588 21,588 21,588 21,588 962,834 2.7875% 34,541,123 11.72% 0.60%

January (Nov) 0 2.7875% 0

February (Dec) 0 2.7875% 0

March (Jan) 0 2.7875% 0

April (Feb) 0 2.7875% 0

May (March) 0 2.7875% 0

June (Apr) 0 2.7875% 0

Total 1,964,257 2,406,215 491,064 122,766 122,766 122,766 122,766 122,766 5,475,366 196,425,680

*   There is a two month lag between the payment and the receipt of Gross Receipts Taxes.

Mission Statement:  The Mission of the Finance Department is to promote excellence, quality and efficiency by enhancing the ability of our employees to serve our internal and external customers 

in an outstanding manner.  We continuously strive to promote and ensure public trust in town government through quality fiscal responsibility.

General Fund 1 ¢ General Fund 1.225 ¢ Capital Improvement 1/4 ¢ Capital Projects 1/16 ¢ (1st) Capital Projects 1/16 ¢ (2nd) Solidwaste 1/16 ¢ Water/Waster 1/16 ¢ (3rd) Water/Waster 1/16 ¢ (4th)

2013-2014 1,952,631 2,391,973 488,158 122,039 122,039 122,039 122,039 121,786

2014-2015 1,964,257 2,406,215 491,064 122,766 122,766 122,766 122,766 122,766

0

500,000

1,000,000

1,500,000

2,000,000

2,500,000

3,000,000

Annual Comparison

General Fund 1 ¢ General Fund 1.225 ¢ Capital Improvement 1/4 ¢ Capital Projects 1/16 ¢ (1st) Capital Projects 1/16 ¢ (2nd) Solidwaste 1/16 ¢ Water/Waster 1/16 ¢ (3rd) Water/Waster 1/16 ¢ (4th)

December 2013 309,166 378,728 77,291 19,323 19,323 19,323 19,323 19,323

December 2014 345,411 423,129 86,353 21,588 21,588 21,588 21,588 21,588

0

50,000

100,000

150,000

200,000

250,000

300,000

350,000

400,000

450,000

Monthly Comparison

Page 1January 27, 2015 -  Page 12



DECEMBER 2014 (OCT 2014 ACTIVITY) 2014 2013 Change in Percent

Classifications (USA/CAN/MEX) $ Amount $ Amount Dollars Change

Agriculture, Forestry, Fishing & Hunting -                       -                    -                 0.00%

Mining and Oil and Gas Extraction -                       -                    -                 0.00%

Utilities 26,120.00            25,211.00         909.00           3.61%

Construction 44,207.00            29,620.00         14,587.00      49.25%

Sector 31-33 - Manufacturing 16,905.00            18,806.00         (1,901.00)       -10.11%

Wholesale Trade 7,171.00              7,483.00           (312.00)          -4.17%

Sector 44-45 - Retail Trade 400,575.00          301,524.00       99,051.00      32.85%

Sector 48-49 - Transportation & Warehousing 634.00                 333.00              301.00           90.39%

Information 23,349.00            19,922.00         3,427.00        17.20%

Finance & Insurance 2,734.00              5,050.00           (2,316.00)       -45.86%

Real Estate, Rental & Leasing 12,986.00            10,150.00         2,836.00        27.94%

Professional, Scientific & Technical Services 35,808.00            32,871.00         2,937.00        8.93%

Admin and Support, Waste Mgt & Remed 20,513.00            18,807.00         1,706.00        9.07%

Education Services 354.00                 709.00              (355.00)          0.00%

Health Care & Social Assistance 42,186.00            46,131.00         (3,945.00)       -8.55%

Arts, Entertainment & Recreation 2,317.00              1,044.00           1,273.00        121.93%

Accommodation & Food Services 147,597.00          125,656.00       21,941.00      17.46%

Other Services (except Public Admin.) 54,260.00            59,784.00         (5,524.00)       -9.24%

Unclassified Establishments 7,745.00              3,992.00           3,753.00        94.01%

SUB-TOTAL 845,461.00          707,093.00       138,368.00    19.57%

Food Distribution 97,006.00            144,296.00       (47,290.00)     -32.77%

Medical Distribution 24,330.00            21,935.55         2,394.45        10.92%

TOTAL 966,797.00          873,324.55       93,472.45      10.70%

January 27, 2015 -  Page 13



FINANCE DEPARTMENT

July, 2013 - June, 2014

General General Capital Capital Capital Water/WastewaterWater/WastewaterTotal Gross Taxable Monthly Average

Fund Fund Improv. Projects Projects Solidwaste Projects Projects Receipts Tax Effective Gross Growth Growth

1 ¢ 1.225 ¢ 1/4 ¢ 1/16 ¢  (1st) 1/16 ¢  (2nd) 1/16 ¢ 1/16 ¢ (3rd) 1/16 ¢ (4th) Revenues Tax Rate Receipts Rate Rate

July (May) 297,203 364,074 74,301 18,575 18,575 18,575 18,575 18,322 828,201 2.7875% 29,711,261 1.35% 1.39%

August (June) 356,710 436,970 89,178 22,294 22,294 22,294 22,294 22,294 994,329 2.7875% 35,671,000 13.99% 7.88%

September (July) 354,567 434,344 88,642 22,160 22,160 22,160 22,160 22,160 988,355 2.7875% 35,456,667 5.04% 6.86%

October (Aug) 330,427 404,773 82,607 20,652 20,652 20,652 20,652 20,652 921,066 2.7875% 33,042,728 1.14% 5.39%

November (Sept) 304,558 373,084 76,139 19,035 19,035 19,035 19,035 19,035 848,955 2.7875% 30,455,795 2.18% 4.78%

December (Oct) 309,166 378,728 77,291 19,323 19,323 19,323 19,323 19,323 861,800 2.7875% 30,916,589 3.65% 4.60%

January (Nov) 276,779 339,054 69,195 17,299 17,299 17,299 17,299 17,299 771,521 2.7875% 27,677,888 0.13% 4.02%

February (Dec) 368,666 451,616 92,166 23,042 23,042 23,042 23,042 23,042 1,027,656 2.7875% 36,866,591 9.88% 4.82%

March (Jan) 279,397 342,262 69,849 17,462 17,462 17,462 17,462 17,462 778,820 2.7875% 27,939,725 -1.99% 4.11%

April (Feb) 284,223 348,173 71,056 17,764 17,764 17,764 17,764 17,764 792,272 2.7875% 28,422,317 8.73% 4.51%

May (March) 301,201 368,971 75,300 18,825 18,825 18,825 18,825 18,825 839,597 2.7875% 30,120,068 -0.73% 4.03%

June (Apr) 285,193 349,361 71,298 17,825 17,825 17,825 17,825 17,825 794,975 2.7875% 28,519,277 6.60% 4.23%

Total 3,748,090 4,591,410 937,022 234,256 234,256 234,256 234,256 234,003 10,447,547 374,799,907

July, 2014 - June, 2015

General General Capital Capital Capital Water/WastewaterWater/WastewaterTotal Gross Taxable Monthly Average

Fund Fund Improv. Projects Projects Solidwaste Projects Projects Receipts Tax Effective Gross Growth Growth

1 ¢ 1.225 ¢ 1/4 ¢ 1/16 ¢  (1st) 1/16 ¢  (2nd) 1/16 ¢ 1/16 ¢ (3rd) 1/16 ¢ (4th) Revenues Tax Rate Receipts Rate Rate

July (May) 286,709 351,219 71,677 17,919 17,919 17,919 17,919 17,919 799,202 2.7875% 28,670,915 -3.50% -3.50%

August (June) 309,470 379,100 77,367 19,342 19,342 19,342 19,342 19,342 862,646 2.7875% 30,946,952 -13.24% -8.82%

September (July) 342,546 419,619 85,637 21,409 21,409 21,409 21,409 21,409 954,848 2.7875% 34,254,622 -3.39% -6.91%

October (Aug) 362,119 443,596 90,530 22,632 22,632 22,632 22,632 22,632 1,009,408 2.7875% 36,211,935 9.59% -2.84%

November (Sept) 318,001 389,552 79,500 19,875 19,875 19,875 19,875 19,875 886,429 2.7875% 31,800,132 4.41% -1.49%

December (Oct) 345,411 423,129 86,353 21,588 21,588 21,588 21,588 21,588 962,834 2.7875% 34,541,123 11.72% 0.60%

January (Nov) 301,469 369,300 75,367 18,842 18,842 18,842 18,842 18,842 840,346 2.7875% 30,146,943 8.92% 1.63%

February (Dec) 0 2.7875% 0

March (Jan) 0 2.7875% 0

April (Feb) 0 2.7875% 0

May (March) 0 2.7875% 0

June (Apr) 0 2.7875% 0

Total 2,265,726 2,775,515 566,432 141,608 141,608 141,608 141,608 141,608 6,315,712 226,572,623

*   There is a two month lag between the payment and the receipt of Gross Receipts Taxes.

Mission Statement:  The Mission of the Finance Department is to promote excellence, quality and efficiency by enhancing the ability of our employees to serve our internal and external customers 

in an outstanding manner.  We continuously strive to promote and ensure public trust in town government through quality fiscal responsibility.

General Fund 1 ¢ General Fund 1.225 ¢ Capital Improvement 1/4 ¢ Capital Projects 1/16 ¢ (1st) Capital Projects 1/16 ¢ (2nd) Solidwaste 1/16 ¢ Water/Waster 1/16 ¢ (3rd) Water/Waster 1/16 ¢ (4th)

2013-2014 2,229,410 2,731,027 557,353 139,338 139,338 139,338 139,338 139,085

2014-2015 2,265,726 2,775,515 566,432 141,608 141,608 141,608 141,608 141,608

0

500,000

1,000,000

1,500,000

2,000,000

2,500,000

3,000,000

Annual Comparison

General Fund 1 ¢ General Fund 1.225 ¢ Capital Improvement 1/4 ¢ Capital Projects 1/16 ¢ (1st) Capital Projects 1/16 ¢ (2nd) Solidwaste 1/16 ¢ Water/Waster 1/16 ¢ (3rd) Water/Waster 1/16 ¢ (4th)

January 2014 276,779 339,054 69,195 17,299 17,299 17,299 17,299 17,299

January 2015 301,469 369,300 75,367 18,842 18,842 18,842 18,842 18,842

0

50,000

100,000

150,000

200,000

250,000

300,000

350,000

400,000

Monthly Comparison

Page 1January 27, 2015 -  Page 14



JANUARY 2014 (NOV 2014 ACTIVITY) 2015 2014 Change in Percent

Classifications (USA/CAN/MEX) $ Amount $ Amount Dollars Change

Agriculture, Forestry, Fishing & Hunting -                       -                    -                 0.00%

Mining and Oil and Gas Extraction -                       -                    -                 0.00%

Utilities 33,013.00            28,908.00         4,105.00        14.20%

Construction 34,736.00            41,244.00         (6,508.00)       -15.78%

Sector 31-33 - Manufacturing 19,021.00            19,483.00         (462.00)          -2.37%

Wholesale Trade 8,131.00              6,794.00           1,337.00        19.68%

Sector 44-45 - Retail Trade 311,504.00          279,730.00       31,774.00      11.36%

Sector 48-49 - Transportation & Warehousing 895.00                 299.00              596.00           199.33%

Information 24,572.00            22,698.00         1,874.00        8.26%

Finance & Insurance 3,822.00              4,577.00           (755.00)          -16.50%

Real Estate, Rental & Leasing 9,324.00              7,089.00           2,235.00        31.53%

Professional, Scientific & Technical Services 38,589.00            25,285.00         13,304.00      52.62%

Admin and Support, Waste Mgt & Remed 10,837.00            12,549.00         (1,712.00)       -13.64%

Education Services 476.00                 175.00              301.00           0.00%

Health Care & Social Assistance 43,314.00            45,311.00         (1,997.00)       -4.41%

Arts, Entertainment & Recreation 2,915.00              972.00              1,943.00        199.90%

Accommodation & Food Services 85,303.00            88,519.00         (3,216.00)       -3.63%

Other Services (except Public Admin.) 50,962.00            44,311.00         6,651.00        15.01%

Unclassified Establishments 9,604.00              1,692.00           7,912.00        467.61%

SUB-TOTAL 687,018.00          629,636.00       57,382.00      9.11%

Food Distribution 141,172.00          132,736.00       8,436.00        6.36%

Medical Distribution 19,550.00            17,887.00         1,663.00        9.30%

TOTAL 847,740.00          780,259.00       67,481.00      8.65%

January 27, 2015 -  Page 15



 

  
 

January 27, 2015  
 

Title:

Draft RFP for Financial Advisor Services

Summary:

Direction to staff on draft Request for Proposals for Financial Advisor Services.

Background:

Staff Recommendation:

Recommend Approval/Disapproval:

Recommend Disapproval

 

Attachments:

Click to download

 Draft RFP 

 

January 27, 2015 -  Page 16



 

 

This Request for Proposal is to request services for a financial advisor to assist the Town 

of Taos in the sale of Refunding Bonds, Revenue Bonds and General Obligation bonds, 

and other financial services as requested. 

 

A. Scope of Services / Schedule of Duties 
 

The Town of Taos (Town) invites firms ("offerors") to submit proposals in accordance 

with the specifications contained in this Request for Proposals ("RFP"). The purpose of 

this procurement is to contract with a financial advisor firm to provide financial services, 

including, but not limited to: 

  

1. Advise and assist Town of Taos Governing Body, general counsel, and staff with 

regard to financial matters, especially bond refinancing(s), rating(s) and sale(s). 

 

2. Survey the Town’s financial resources and existing indebtedness and advise as to 

the proper course of action and policy direction to achieve an optimal financial 

profile. 

 

3. Evaluate the cash flow from any revenue sources that may constitute security for 

any obligation incurred. 

 

4. Analyze and report on the advantages and disadvantages of each proposed 

financing. 

 

5. Prepare a written plan for financing the Airport Expansion Project and other 

major Town projects that may arise. 

 

6. Assemble and transmit to the Bond Attorney (s), State agencies, and or Trust 

Banks as required in the preparation of the necessary petitions, resolutions, 

notices and certificates.  Submit such documents to the Governing Body for 

appropriate action. 

 

7. Assist bond counsel in preparing the text of an official statement as required.  The 

official statement and disclosure documents.  Official statements will include a 

description of the securities, the project and pertinent financial and economic 

data.  In the preparation of such an official statement, assist the Town in 

ascertaining material facts and circumstances regarding the project.  The official 

statement will be printed and mailed, together with copies of the official notice of 

sale and basic legal documents to a comprehensive list of prospective bidders. 

 

8. Recommend various provisions, terms, and conditions of proposed bond issues. 

Work with the Town’s bond counsel and financing team in recommending size, 

structure, specific terms and conditions of a debt issue.  Present information 

regarding methods of sale, including publicly offered and privately negotiated 

options. 

 

January 27, 2015 -  Page 17



 

 

9. Assist the Town in obtaining the best bond rating from the bond rating agencies. 

 

10. Manage competitive or negotiated sale process.  Arrange for advertising and 

premarketing of issue.  Prepare the prospectus, official notice of sale, and bid 

forms for bond sale(s).  Furnish these documents in a timely manner to the Town, 

financial publications, rating agencies, and prospective bidders as appropriate.  

Represent the Town at the bid opening for a public sale and analyze the bids, 

identify the most favorable bid, and made a recommendation as to award of the 

bid.  Act as the Town’s agent if bid negotiations are required.  After the bid is 

awarded, prepare an actual debt service table based on accepted coupon rates.  

 

11. Assist the Town in closing the financing, which includes assistance in selecting a 

bond printer and coordinate their delivery, and in advising the Town on the 

investment of proceeds pending expenditures. 

 

12. Attend meetings of the Town Council or Town Staff to make oral presentations of 

the results from either recommendations or prepared reports, to the Town 

Manager, Assistant Town Manager, Finance Director and to the Town Council. 

 

13. Provide advice regarding the debt financing plans and strategies of other entities, 

which are related to the health, safety and public welfare of the citizens of the 

Town of Taos. 

 

14. Work with Town staff to review, update and/or develop policies and procedures 

related to Town’s financial management. 

 

15. Provide other services as reasonably requested by the Town. 

  
 

January 27, 2015 -  Page 18



 

  
 

January 27, 2015  
 

Title:

Activities, Road Closures, Farmers Market

Summary:

Presentations, discussion, consideration and possible action or direction to staff concerning closing the Plaza to vehicular traffic as 

well as various roads throughout town for activities, parades, special events and possibly the Farmers Market.

Background:

Staff Recommendation:

Recommend Approval/Disapproval:

Recommend Disapproval

 

Attachments:

Click to download

No Attachments Available

 

January 27, 2015 -  Page 19



 

  
 

January 27, 2015  
 

Title:

License for Use of Airport Well

Summary:

Discussion, consideration and possible approval of a License between the Town of Taos and Northern Mountain Constructors, Inc. 

for the use of the airport well to pump water to be used for the construction of the airport.

Background:

Staff Recommendation:

Recommend Approval/Disapproval:

Recommend Disapproval

 

Attachments:

Click to download

No Attachments Available

 

January 27, 2015 -  Page 20



 

  
 

January 27, 2015  
 

Title:

Amendment No. 1 to Contract TT-15-01 with Griffin and Associates

Summary:

Consideration and possible approval of Amendment No. 1 to contract TT-15-01 with Griffin and Associates for the marketing and 

advertising of the Town of Taos as a tourist destination.

Background:

The additional funds of  $40,000 will be funded by the New Mexico Tourism Grant.

Staff Recommendation:

Recommend Approval/Disapproval:

Recommend Approval

 

Attachments:

Click to download

 Amendment No. 1 to Contract TT-15-01 

 Procurment Review 

 Grant Agreement 

 Contract Balance Spreadsheet 

 

January 27, 2015 -  Page 21



January 27, 2015 -  Page 22



January 27, 2015 -  Page 23



January 27, 2015 -  Page 24



January 27, 2015 -  Page 25



January 27, 2015 -  Page 26



January 27, 2015 -  Page 27



January 27, 2015 -  Page 28



January 27, 2015 -  Page 29



January 27, 2015 -  Page 30



January 27, 2015 -  Page 31



January 27, 2015 -  Page 32



January 27, 2015 -  Page 33



January 27, 2015 -  Page 34



 

  
 

January 27, 2015  
 

Title:

Proposed Ordinance, Fine Schedule and Conditions

Summary:

Proposed ordinance, schedule and conditions for fire department fines and fees. For discussion purposes for the information of 

Council and to receive direction to staff as to the scheduling for a public hearing as a proposed ordinance.

Background:

Staff Recommendation:

Recommend Approval/Disapproval:

Recommend Disapproval

 

Attachments:

Click to download

 Proposed Ordinance 

 Proposed Citation Program 

 Proposed Inspection Citation 

 

January 27, 2015 -  Page 35



 
PROPOSED 

 

TOWN OF TAOS 

ORDINANCE 15-__ 

 

AN ORDINANCE ADOPTING BY REFERENCE THE 2015 INTERNATIONAL 

FIRE CODE REGULATING AND GOVERNING THE SAFEGUARDING OF 

LIFE AND PROPERTY FROM FIRE AND EXPLOSION HAZARDS AND FROM 

CONDITIONS HAZARDOUS TO LIFE OR PROPERTY IN THE OCCUPANCY 

OF BUILDINGS AND PREMISES IN THE TOWN OF TAOS; ADOPTING 

CERTAIN CHANGES TO THE 2015 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE; 

REPEALING AND REPLACING TOWN OF TAOS CODE SECTION 8.12, FIRE 

PREVENTION; ADOPTING A FINE SCHEDULE AND CITATION PROGRAM, 

AND REPEALING ANY OTHER PROVISION OF THE TOWN CODE OR ANY 

OTHER ORDINANCE CLEARLY INCONSISTENT WITH THIS ORDINANCE. 

 

 WHEREAS, the International Code Council has issued the International Fire 

Code, 2015 edition (“2015 International Fire Code”), designed to update state and local 

fire codes throughout the United States, make them more uniform, and make them more 

consistent and compatible with related codes such as building codes; 

WHEREAS the Town Council finds that the 2015 International Fire Code 

provides a more comprehensive and modern set of fire-related regulations than those 

existing under the present Town Code; 

WHEREAS the Town Council finds that the 2015 International Fire Code is 

more consistent with the uniform building codes that the Town has adopted than are the 

provisions of the present Town Code adopting fire codes (specifically Section 8.12.10 of 

the present Town Code; 

January 27, 2015 -  Page 36



                                                       Ordinance 15-__                                           Page 2 of 6 
 

WHEREAS the Town Council finds that the adoption of the 2015 International 

Fire Code, with certain relatively minor modifications, will assist the Town’s fire 

officials and firefighters in their tasks of minimizing risks to life and property from fire 

and explosions; 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE Governing Body of the 

Town of Taos, meeting in Regular Session, this 24th day of February, 2015, after having 

held a duly noticed public hearing on the matter, hereby adopts the following provisions. 

1. This ordinance repeals Town Code Chapter 8.12, Fire Prevention, Section 

010, “Codes Adopted,” and replaces that section with the following: 

A. There is adopted by reference, with the exceptions and changes set forth in 

Subparagraph E below, the International Code Council’s 2015 International Fire Code for 

the purposes of regulating and governing the safeguarding of life and property from fire 

and explosion hazards and from conditions hazardous to life or property in the occupancy 

of buildings and premises in the town of Taos. 

B. The 2015 International Fire Code is incorporated by reference into this 

Town Code as if fully set out herein, and shall be controlling with respect to the Town  

except as modified in Subparagraph E below, or inconsistent with State law or regulation.   

If any provision of this Code is inconsistent with state law or regulation regulating the 

safeguarding of life and property from fire and explosion hazards and from conditions 

hazardous to life or property in the occupancy of buildings and premises related to fire 

prevention, the state law or regulation controls. 

 C. All provisions of the Town of Taos Code not repealed and replaced by this 

section, including all sections of Chapter 8.12, Fire Prevention, other than Section 

January 27, 2015 -  Page 37



                                                       Ordinance 15-__                                           Page 3 of 6 
 

8.12.010, remain in place and in force except to the extent, if any, that they are 

inconsistent with the provisions of this section or with state law.  

 D. A true and correct copy of the 2015 International Fire Code shall be 

maintained by the Town Clerk and made available to any member of the public for 

inspection and copying during regular business hours.  A copying fee may be charged for 

copies made.   

 E. Certain provisions of the 2015 International Fire Code are modified as 

follows: 

 i. Section 101, “General,” subsection 101.1 Title, is modified to insert the 

“the Town of Taos” in the brackets so that the subsection will read: 

 101.1  Title.  These regulations shall be known as the Fire Code of 
the Town of Taos, hereafter referred to as “this code.” 

 
 ii. Section 101, “General,” subsection 2.1, “Appendices” is modified to 

provide:   

101.2.1 Appendicies.  Appendix B, Fire-Flow Requirements 
for Buildings; Appendix C, Fire Hydrant Locations and 
Distribution; Appendix D, Fire Apparatus Access Roads; 
Appendix E, Hazard Categories; Appendix F, Hazard Ranking; and 
Appendix G, Cryogenic Fluids- Weight and Volume Equivalents;  
Appendix H, Hazardous Materials Management Plan (HMMP) and 
Hazardous Materials Inventory Statement (HMIS) Instructions; 
Appendix I, Fire Protection Systems- Noncompliant Conditions; 
Appendix J, Building Information Sign; Appendix K, Construction 
Requirements for Existing Ambulatory Care Facilities are adopted.  
Appendix A, Board of Appeals is not adopted. 

 
 iii. Section 108, “Board of Appeals,” subsection 108.1, “Board of Appeals 

established” is modified by changing the third sentence to read, “The Fire Marshal or his 

designee shall be an ex officio member of said board but shall have no vote on any mater 

before the board.”   

January 27, 2015 -  Page 38



                                                       Ordinance 15-__                                           Page 4 of 6 
 

 iv. Section 108, “Board of Appeals,” Subsection 108.3, “Qualifications,” is 

modified by striking the words “and are not employees of the jurisdiction” at the end of 

the sentence so that the subsection reads, “The board of appeals shall consist of members 

who are qualified by experience and training to pass on matters pertaining to hazards of 

fire, explosions, hazardous conditions or fire protection systems.” 

v. Section 109, “Violations,” subsection 109.4 “Violation Penalties,” is 

modified by placing the words “petty misdemeanor” in the first set of brackets; placing 

the words “five hundred dollars ($500.00)” in the second set of brackets; and placing the 

words “ninety (90) days” in the third set of brackets, so that the provision will read: 

 109.4 Violation Penalties.  Persons who shall violate a provision 
of this code or shall fail to comply with any of the requirements 
thereof or who shall erect, install, alter, repair or do work in 
violation of the approved construction documents or directive of 
the fire code official, or of a permit or certificate used under 
provisions of this code, shall be guilty of a petty misdemeanor, 
punishable by a fine of not more than five hundred ($500.00) 
dollars or by imprisonment not exceeding ninety (90) days, or both 
such fine and imprisonment.  Each day that a violation continues 
after due notice has been served shall be deemed a separate 
offense.  

  

 vi. Section 111, “Stop Work Order,” subsection 111.4, “Failure to comply” is 

modified by inserting “fifty dollars ($50.00)” in the first set of brackets and “five hundred 

dollars” ($500.00) in the second set of brackets so that the full provision reads: 

 111.4 Failure to comply.  Any person who shall continue any 
work after having been served with a stop work order, except such 
work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or 
unsafe condition, shall be liable to a fine of not less than fifty dollars 
($50.00) or more than five hundred dollars ($500.00). 

 

January 27, 2015 -  Page 39



                                                       Ordinance 15-__                                           Page 5 of 6 
 

 vii. Section 202, “General Definitions,” is modified to add the following 

definition: 

AHJ, Authority Having Jurisdiction. The Fire Chief, Fire Marshal, 
Code Enforcement Officer, or department-approved designee of the 
Town of Taos Fire Department. 

 
 viii. Section 903, “Automatic Sprinkler Systems,” Subsection 903.2, “Where 

required,” “Exception,” shall be modified by adding to the end of the “Exception” 

paragraph, “with installation of approved alternative extinguishment system, where 

required by fire code official” so that the full “Exception” paragraph (which appears 

immediately before 903.2.1) reads: 

  Exception:  Spaces or areas in telecommunications buildings 
used exclusively for telecommunications equipment, associated 
electrical power distribution equipment, batteries and standby 
engines, provided those spaces or areas are equipped throughout 
with an automatic fire alarm system and are separated from the 
remainder of the building by not less than 1-hour fire barriers 

constructed in accordance with Section 707 of the International 

Building Code or not less than 2-hour horizontal assemblies 
constructed in accordance with Section 711 of the International 

Building Code, or both, with the installation of an approved 
alternative extinguishment system, where required by the Fire 
Code Official. 

 
  

 2. The attached Citation Program and Fine Schedule are hereby 

adopted. 

 3. Severability.  If any provision of this ordinance is, for any 

reason, held to be unconstitutional or otherwise unlawful by a court of 

competent jurisdiction, such decision shall not affect the legality or validity 

or enforceability of any other provision of this ordinance.   The Council 

hereby declares that it would have passed this ordinance irrespective of the 

January 27, 2015 -  Page 40



                                                       Ordinance 15-__                                           Page 6 of 6 
 

fact that any one or more of its provisions would be declared 

unconstitutional or otherwise unlawful. 

 4. This ordinance shall be effective immediately upon its final 

passage and adoption.   

This ordinance shall become effective as provided by law. 

ORDAINED, ADOPTED, AND APPROVED this 24th of February, 2015 by the 
following vote: 
 
Mayor Pro Tem Andrew T. Gonzales    
Councilmember Frederick A. Peralta    
Councilmember George “Fritz” Hahn    
Councilmember Judith Y. Cantu    

 

 

TOWN OF TAOS 

 

 

__________________________ 

Daniel R. Barrone, Mayor 

 

ATTEST: APPROVED AS TO FORM 

 

 

_______________________________ ______________________________ 

Renee Lucero, Town Clerk Floyd W. Lopez, Town Attorney 

 

 

 

January 27, 2015 -  Page 41



 

TAOS FIRE DEPARTMENT 

Code Enforcement Division 
323 Camino de la Placita Taos, NM 87571 575-758-3386 

 

Fire Code Citation Program  
The goal of the Taos Fire Department is for voluntary compliance in correcting any Fire 
Code violations found during our fire inspection programs. We hope that education about 
the fire code requirements and their potential for harm will cause the owner/occupant to 
take corrective action.  
 
However, there are times where we must use a citation as a response to fire code violations 
that endanger the public. Citations impose an immediate financial impact on those 
responsible for these code violations in an attempt to discourage repeat offenses.  
 

Citations  
If an officer with the Fire Marshal’s office determines that a violation of the Fire Code has 
occurred, a citation may be issued to the individual who committed the violation. Citable 
violations include, but are not limited to:  
 

� Failure to obtain any required permits or failure to adhere to permit conditions.  
 

� Failure to adhere to assigned occupant load limits within occupancy.  
 

� Blocked or obstructed exits; exit corridor or aisle obstructed or width reduced.  
 

� Fire alarm device or fire extinguishing system blocked, obstructed or otherwise 
rendered unusable.  

 
� Parking in a posted or marked fire lane on a private street or public property, 

blocking or obstructing any fire hydrant or fire department connection  
 

� Possession or use of illegal fireworks.  
 

� Illegal Storage/use of fireworks or explosives.  
 

� Illegal occupancy in violation of Building/Fire Code.  
 

� Burning in violation of Fire Code and Town Ordinances.  
 

� Repetitive false alarms in occupancies or businesses equipped with fire, smoke 
and/or sprinkler flow detection systems.  

 
� Knowingly maintaining a fire hazard by failure to correct fire code violations noted in 

writing. 
 

January 27, 2015 -  Page 42



� Violations that would constitute or contribute to an immediate and/or imminent 
hazard to life and/or property. 

 
 
Process of Citation  
Any notice of violation, with the exception of the issuance of criminal process, will specify a 
period during which the violator must correct the violation. If the violation is not corrected 
within such specified time, the violator is subject to being cited for a new and separate 
offense(s).  
The following process will be followed unless there is an immediate or life safety issue.  
1. Written violations of the fire code will be issued to the owner, occupant, or representative 
of the property owner, with time given to correct the violation.  

2. If no corrections are made:  
a. A civil citation may be issued; and  
b. Criminal charges may be sought through the court. 
 
All appeals shall be made through the court, and fines shall be paid to the Town of Taos. 
 
 

False Alarm Ordinance Fines 
1

st
 Alarm Free 

2
nd

 Alarm Free 
3

rd
 Alarm $50.00 

4
th
 Alarm $50.00 

5
th
 Alarm $100.00 

6
th
 Alarm $100.00 

7
th
 Alarm $500.00 

8
or 

more Alarms $500.00 and/or revocation of Alarm Permit 
No Key Holder Response $125.00 

 
 
 

Citation Fee Schedule 
Occupancy Posting 
Requirements- 
Address, evacuation plan, 
occupancy load, etc.  

$ 25.00  
 

Fire Extinguisher- Lack of or 
out of compliance 

$50.00 

Open Burning without a 
permit, per violation 

$ 300.00 

Failure to secure a permit, per 
violation 

$ 250.00   

General Fire Code Violations  
Subsequent Violation of same 
code 

$ 100.00  
$ 50.00 

Life Safety Violations $ 500.00 

 

January 27, 2015 -  Page 43



Office: 575-758-3386

Fax: 575-737-2665

THE TAOS FIRE DEPARTMENTS CODE ENFORCEMENT OFFICE ALLEGES THAT ON THE __________ 

DAY OF ________, 20______THE TOWN OF TAOS FIRE PREVENTION CODE WAS UNLAWFULLY AND 

WILLFULLY VIOLATED BY:

(NAME): __________________________________________________________________________

LOCATION / ADDRESS: ______________________________________________________________

TYPE OF OCCUPANCY

GENERAL FIRE OR FIRE SAFETY HAZARD $100.00

  ASSEMBLY APPROVED FIRE EVACUATION PLAN NOT POSTED $25.00

  BUSINESS STREET ADDRESS NOT POSTED $25.00

  EDUCATIONAL STREET ADDRESS NOT VISIBLE $25.00

  INDUSTRIAL BREACH IN FIRE WALL / FIRE STOPS $100.00

  INSTITUTIONAL FIRE / EXIT DOOR INOPERATIVE $300.00

  MERCANTILE FIRE ALARM INOPERATIVE $300.00

  RESIDENTIAL SPRINKLER SYSTEM INOPERATIVE $300.00

  STORAGE SPRINKLER SYSTEM NOT COMPLYING WITH CODE $100.00

  VACANT PORTABLE FIRE EXTINGUISHERS $50.00

 OPEN BURNING OVERCROWDING $250.00

OCCUPANCY LOAD CERTIFICATE NOT POSTED $25.00

BLOCKED MEANS OF EGRESS $500.00

TOTAL VIOLATIONS: _________ BLOCKED STAIRWELL/STAIRWAY $500.00

EXIT ILLUMINATION AND MARKING $50.00

LOCKED OR CHAINED EXIT DOORS $500.00

EXIT /EGRESS DOOR NEEDS REPAIR $50.00

FIRE EXIT / AISLE BLOCKED $500.00

CITATION AMOUNT: $_________ SPRAY BOOTH NOT COMPLYING TO CODE $100.00

STANDPIPE SYSTEM NOT COMPLYING WITH CODE $100.00

ILLEGAL OPEN BURNING $300.00

YOU ARE HEREBY FINED FOR THE ABOVE FIRE CODE VIOLATION(S). YOU MAY APPEAR IN THE

TOWN OF TAOS MUNICIPAL COURT AT 114 CIVIC PLAZA DRIVE, TAOS, NM 87571, AT:__________________

OR YOU CAN MAKE CHECKS PAYABLE TO THE TOWN OF TAOS.

FAILURE TO PAY THE FINES(S) WITHIN 30 DAYS WILL RESULT IN THE FILING OF ADDITIONAL CIVIL FINES AND/OR 

CRIMINAL ACTIONS AGAINST YOU THROUGH THE COURT. EACH DAY THE VIOLATION(S) CONTINUES TO EXIST 

SHALL CONSTITUTE A SEPARATE OFFENSE FOR THE PURPOSE OF ISSUING ADDITIONAL CITATIONS.

DATE: ______________________ Inspector: _____________________________________

ACKNOWLEDGE RECEIPT OF THIS CITATION: _____________________________________________

FIRE CODE VIOLATION CITATION

TAOS FIRE DEPARTMENT

FIRE PREVENTION INSPECTION

323 Camino de la Placita

Taos, NM 87571  

  

FINE SCHEDULE

January 27, 2015 -  Page 44



 

  
 

January 27, 2015  
 

Title:

Other Matters

Summary:

Background:

Staff Recommendation:

Recommend Approval/Disapproval:

Recommend Disapproval

 

Attachments:

Click to download

No Attachments Available

 

January 27, 2015 -  Page 45



 

  
 

January 27, 2015  
 

Title:

Other Matters

Summary:

Background:

Staff Recommendation:

Recommend Approval/Disapproval:

Recommend Disapproval

 

Attachments:

Click to download

No Attachments Available

 

January 27, 2015 -  Page 46



 

  
 

January 27, 2015  
 

Title:

Potential Meeting with Taos Pueblo Tribal Government Officials

Summary:

Invitation from the Mayor and Council to meet with the Taos Pueblo Tribal Government officials.

Background:

Staff Recommendation:

Recommend Approval/Disapproval:

Recommend Disapproval

 

Attachments:

Click to download

No Attachments Available

 

January 27, 2015 -  Page 47



 

  
 

January 27, 2015  
 

Title:

Potential Date for a Joint Meeting

Summary:

Discussion regarding a potential date for a joint meeting between the Town and the County.

Background:

Staff Recommendation:

Recommend Approval/Disapproval:

Recommend Disapproval

 

Attachments:

Click to download

No Attachments Available

 

January 27, 2015 -  Page 48



 

  
 

January 27, 2015  
 

Title:

Workshop Meeting Date(s)

Summary:

Discussion the next Workshop Meeting date(s).

Background:

Staff Recommendation:

Recommend Approval/Disapproval:

Recommend Disapproval

 

Attachments:

Click to download

No Attachments Available

 

January 27, 2015 -  Page 49



 

  
 

January 27, 2015  
 

Title:

Other Matters

Summary:

Background:

Staff Recommendation:

Recommend Approval/Disapproval:

Recommend Disapproval

 

Attachments:

Click to download

No Attachments Available

 

January 27, 2015 -  Page 50



 

  
 

January 27, 2015  
 

Title:

Other Matters

Summary:

Background:

Staff Recommendation:

Recommend Approval/Disapproval:

Recommend Disapproval

 

Attachments:

Click to download

No Attachments Available

 

January 27, 2015 -  Page 51



 

  
 

January 27, 2015  
 

Title:

Town of Taos/UNM Parking Agreement

Summary:

Discussion, consideration and possible action regarding a parking agreement between the Town of Taos and UNM for use by UNM-

Taos downtown campus students of parking at the Town Hall and Library.

Background:

Staff Recommendation:

Recommend Approval/Disapproval:

Recommend Disapproval

 

Attachments:

Click to download

No Attachments Available

 

January 27, 2015 -  Page 52



 

  
 

January 27, 2015  
 

Title:

PERSONNEL MATTERS

Summary:

(Executive and Public Session Informational Items/Action Items) Discussion, consideration, and decisions regarding limited 

personnel matters relating to the final recommendations for the Employee Compensation Plan.  These items may be discussed in 

closed session under Open Meetings Act exemption 10-15-1-(H)(2), which allows for discussion of limited personnel matters.

Background:

Staff Recommendation:

Recommend Approval/Disapproval:

Recommend Disapproval

 

Attachments:

Click to download

No Attachments Available

 

January 27, 2015 -  Page 53



 

  
 

January 27, 2015  
 

Title:

PERSONNEL MATTERS

Summary:

(Executive and Public Session Informational Items/Action Items) Discussion, consideration, decisions and possible direction to 

staff regarding limited personnel matters relating to the positions of Tourism and Marketing Director and Planning, Community and 

Economic Development Director.  These items may be discussed in closed session under Open Meetings Act exemption 10-15-1-(H)

(2), which allows for discussion of limited personnel matters.

Background:

Staff Recommendation:

Recommend Approval/Disapproval:

Recommend Disapproval

 

Attachments:

Click to download

No Attachments Available

 

January 27, 2015 -  Page 54


